CITY OF WASILLA

290 E. HERNING AVE.
WASILLA, ALASKA 99654-7091
PHONE: (907) 373-9050
FAX: (907) 373-9085

COUNCIL MEMORANDUM NO. 93-31

Date: April 20, 1993
/;
From: Irl T. Stambaugb;PChief of Police
Thru: John Stein, Mayor 9&
To: Wasilla City Council
Subject: Police Equipment Bid Award

The City of Wasilla received six bids for providing police equipment to the Wasilla Police

Department.

Recommend that Council approve the award of contracts as follows:

Chimo Guns of Wasilla was the low bidder on the following equipment.

2.  Leather Belts 185.22
3. Holsters 464.58
4.  Handcuff cases 126.99
6.  Cap Stun Holders 9792
7. Cap Stun 83.76 _
10. Key Ring Holders 65.61 AFPPRUVE
11. Clip Holders 111.585 Mo e
12, Belt Keepers 51.48 oare: /" | il
13. Glock Magazines 477.36 BY: Y/ Lla o
14. .45 Glock Handguns 3,827.25
186.  Ammunition-Target 800.00
17.  Ammunition-Duty 84.90

Total $6,476.62

Northern Security of Anchorage was the low bidder on the following equipment.

1. Parkas 2,385.00
B, Peerless Handcuffs 145.80
8. Baton Ring 37.80
g Baton 78.20

Total $2,647.80

Great Guns of Anchorage was the low bidder on the following equipment.

15. Body Armor 2,780.00
Total $2,790.00
TOTAL BID AWARD $11,814.42



Project: Police Equipment

City oF WASILLA
COMPILATION OF BIDS

Page 1

Project #:
Location: Opened At: City Hall Compiled By: Erling P. Nelson
By: Irl Stambaugh Checked By: Irl Stambaugh
Date: 4/19/83 Date: 4/18/93
Vendor Name == TSI Chimo Guns Northern Security Great Guns
Item Description Quantity | Unit Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Taotal
# Price Price Price Price
1 Parkas 3,150.00 No Bid 2,385.00 No Bid
2 Leather Belts 22473 185.22 29925 269.55
3 Holsters 615.60 46458 620.55 674.53
4 Handcuff Case 143.73 126.99 13725 152.55
5 Peerless Handcuffs 148.50 194.40 145.80 206.10
6 Cap Stun Holder 134.73 9782 142.83 137.16
7 Cap Stun 162.00 83.76 143.40 108.00
8 Baton Ring 4041 52.56 37.80 53.10
9 Baton 35.10 No Bid 79.20 87.30
10 Key Ring Holder 89.73 6561 77.40 111.60
11 Clip Holder 125.73 111.55 152.55 177.03
12 Belt Keeper 105.84 51.48 7002 11340
13 Glock Magazines 42300 477.36 47250 504.00
14 45 Glock Handguns 3,686.40 3.827.25 No Bids 3.8937.77
15 Body Armor 267300 No Bid 3,136.50 2,79000
16 Ammunition-Target 1,187.00 800.00 912.00 104500
17 Ammunition-Duty 158.70 84.80 174.00 104.50
Total This Page ==




CiTy oF WASILLA
COMPILATION OF BIDS

Project: Police Equipment

Project #:

Opened At: City Hall Compiled By: Erling P. Nelson

Location:

By: Irl Stambaugh
Date: 4/19/83

Checked By: Irl Stambaugh
Date: 4/19/93

N sttt e ——————
_——— s ey

Vendor Name Silverton Company RAL.

item Description Quantity | Unit Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total

# Price Price Price Price

1 Parkas No Bid 2,205.00
+ 10%

2 Leather Belts 42.00 378.00 507.15

3 Holsters 82.00 828.00 1,046.25

4 Handcuff Case 2500 225.00 310.50

5 Peerless Handcuffs No Bid 243.00

6 Cap Stun Holder No Bid 2738.00

7 Cap Stun No Bid 198.00

8 Baton Ring 950 85.50 8450

8 Baton No Bid 175.50

10 Key Ring Holder 17.00 153.00 182.25

11 Clip Holder 33.00 29700 337.50

12 Belt Keeper 6.00 54.00 37800

13 Glock Magazines 26.00 234.00 540.00

14 45 Glock Handguns 456.24 4,106.16 4,275.00

15 Body Armor 485.00 4,365.00 4,482.00

16 Ammunition-Target No Bid 1,300.00

17 Ammunition-Duty No Bid 108.00

Total This Page




